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For many endangered Indigenous languages, corpora, if existing at all, often at their largest 
amount only up to several tens or hundreds of thousands of words, and thus appear tiny in 
comparison to those currently available for the majority languages of the world, with corpora 
adding up to billions of words, and ever increasing. In corpus linguistics, it has been taken for 
granted that more and more data is almost always be better, but does that mean that there is 
not much to be learnt from much smaller corpora? 
 
Plains Cree (crk: nÄ“hiyawÄ“win) is an Algonquian language still spoken by several thousands 
of people in the Western Plains, primarily in the Canadian provinces of Alberta and 
Saskatchewan, as well as in Manitoba, and in Montana on the American side of the border. 
Often mentioned characteristics of Plains Cree (and Algonquian languages in general) are its 
rich, polysynthetic morphological system, in particular for verbs, with a number of circumfixes 
and other parallel long-term word-internal morphological dependencies, as well as its four-way 
classification of verbs according to their transitivity and the animacy of the principal arguments 
(subject and object). A morpho-syntactic feature of note is the marking of both the subject and 
the object on the verb, when these arguments are animate, which allows in principle for not 
explicitly expressing one or both these arguments as nouns or pronouns in the immediate 
context. As for general syntactic traits, Plains Cree is traditionally described as having a flexible 
word order. 
 
The largest available corpus for Plains Cree is a collection of contemporary texts adding up to 
some 100 thousand word tokens, which were recorded, transcribed, translated, and edited by 
Freda Ahenakew and H. Chris Wolfart in the 1980s and 1990s, thus known as the 
Ahenakew-Wolfart corpus (Arppe at al., in press; Ahenakew, 2000; Bear et al., 1992; 
KaÌ‚-NiÌ‚piteÌ‚hteÌ‚w, 1998; Masuskapoe, 2010; Minde, 1997; Vandall & Douquette, 1987; 
Whitecalf, 1993). 
 
Moreover, thanks to having access to largest lexical database for Plains Cree (Wolvengrey 
2001) as well as the accompanying complete basic paradigms (multiple p.c. from Wolvengrey), 
we have been able to create a finite-state based (e.g. Beesley & Karttunen, 2003) 
computational morphological model of Plains Cree (Snoek et al. 2014; Harrigan et al. 2017). 
Furthermore, we have also developed a constraint-grammar-based (Karlsson 1990) 
surface-syntactic model for morpho-syntactic disambiguation and identifying verbal arguments 
(Schmirler et al. 2018). 
 
The development of the aforementioned morphological and syntactic computational models, as 
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